

MIDDLETON REUTLINGER

A Professional Service Corporation
401 S. Fourth Street, Suite 2600
Louisville, Kentucky 40202-3410
502.584.1135

Federal I.D. #61-0999942

June 27, 2016

Billing 6/30/2016

Invoice #ZU310 - 16001 - 229890 MSF

RECEIVED
JUN 28 2016
BY: mc

MR. TOMMY ELLIOTT
324 BROWNS LANE
LOUISVILLE, KY 40207

Approval #1 _____

Approval #2 _____

G/L Account 141L

Handwritten:
6-28-2016

MRS. MARY HELEN PETER
18 PEMBROKE ROAD
LOUISVILLE, KY 40220

ELLIOTT, TOMMY AND PETER, MARY HELEN/KRS (KENTUCKY
RETIREMENT SERVICES)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

6/20/2016	KLC	DRAFT AMENDED VERIFIED COMPLAINT; TELEPHONE CALLS AND EMAILS WITH LOCAL NEWSPAPERS AND OTHER NEWS OUTLETS IN RESPONSE TO INQUIRIES REGARDING LAWSUIT; TELEPHONE CALLS WITH CLIENTS TO REGARDING LAWSUIT STATUS AND STRATEGY; REVIEW AND ANALYZE EO 2016-340 AND ISSUES FOR AMENDED MOTION FOR INJUNCTION	6.20	hrs	\$260 /hr	\$1,612.00
6/20/2016	DLC	PREPARED AMENDED MOTION FOR TEMPORARY INJUNCTION	5.00	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$1,375.00
6/20/2016	DLC	RESEARCHED LAW ON ISSUES FOR AMENDED MOTION	1.00	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$275.00
6/20/2016	DLC	REVIEWED AND REVISED AMENDED VERIFIED COMPLAINT	1.00	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$275.00
6/20/2016	DLC	TELEPHONED CLIENTS TO DISCUSS AMENDED MOTION AND VERIFIED COMPLAINT	1.00	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$275.00

6/20/2016	KTR	RESEARCH KRS STATUTES AND KENTUCKY CONSTITUTION SECTIONS RELIED ON BY GOV. BEVIN IN ISSUING HIS EXECUTIVE ORDER; DRAFT MEMO REGARDING SAME; RESEARCH SENATE BILL 2 AND ITS HISTORY REGARDING THE RETIREMENT SYSTEM	1.80	hrs	\$195 /hr	\$351.00
6/20/2016	KTR	REVIEW AND ANALYZE STATUS OF CASE, AMENDED COMPLAINT AND POTENTIAL TRO. TELECONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS REGARDING CASE STATUS; REVIEW COMPLAINT IN WORKER'S COMP CASE REGARDING REORGANIZATION STATUTE; CONFERENCE REGARDING DRAFTING AMENDED MOTION FOR INJUNCTION; BEGIN RESEARCHING KENTUCKY CASE LAW AND ARTICLES ON KRS 12.028	4.20	hrs	\$195 /hr	\$819.00
6/21/2016	KLC	MEET WITH CLIENT REGARDING AMENDED COMPLAINT; COMPLETE AMENDED COMPLAINT AND PREPARE FOR FILING; EMAIL THE FOLLOWING REGARDING FILING OF AMENDED COMPLAINT AND SETTING OF INJUNCTION HEARING: COUNSEL FOR GOVERNOR BEVIN; COUNSEL FOR SECRETARIES LANDRUM AND STEPHENS; THE ATTORNEY GENERAL; AND KRS; TELEPHONE CALL WITH ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE REGARDING STATUS OF LAWSUIT; RESPOND TO MEDIA OUTLETS REGARDING AMENDED COMPLAINT FILING; REVIEW ISSUES REGARDING AMENDED INJUNCTION MOTION	5.10	hrs	\$260 /hr	\$1,326.00
6/21/2016	DLC	DRAFTED AMENDED MOTION FOR TEMPORARY INJUNCTION	2.20	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$605.00
6/21/2016	DLC	EMAILED CLIENTS REGARDING UPDATE ON CASE	0.40	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$110.00
6/21/2016	MKR	RESEARCH COURTNET ON CASE 16-CI-00552 (WC CASE) AND PULL RECENT DOCKET AND RECENT FILINGS	0.20	hrs	\$130 /hr	\$26.00
6/21/2016	MKR	MEET TO DISCUSS HEARING AND AMENDED COMPLAINT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE EMAILS REGARDING SAME	0.20	hrs	\$130 /hr	\$26.00

6/21/2016	KTR	REVIEW AMENDED COMPLAINT; CONTINUE RESEARCHING KRS 12.028 AND RELEVANT CASE LAW; UPDATE MEMO IN SUPPORT OF AMENDED MOTION FOR TEMPORARY INJUNCTION; CONFERENCE REGARDING STATUS OF CASE; CONTACT JUDGE SHEPHERD'S OFFICE TO OBTAIN HEARING DATE AND TIME	3.90	hrs	\$195 /hr	\$760.50
6/22/2016	KLC	REVISE DRAFT OF AMENDED TEMPORARY INJUNCTION MOTION AND MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT; COMMUNICATION WITH CLIENTS REGARDING UPCOMING INJUNCTION HEARING; EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH COUNSEL REGARDING AMENDED INJUNCTION MOTION; REVIEW AND ANALYZE ATTORNEY GENERAL'S COMPLAINT AND MOTIONS; REVIEW POTENTIAL INJUNCTION RESPONSE FROM GOVERNOR'S COUNSEL	6.70	hrs	\$260 /hr	\$1,742.00
6/22/2016	DLC	REVISED PRESS STATEMENT FOR CLIENTS, TELEPHONE CALLS WITH CLIENTS TO DISCUSS HEARING	1.00	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$275.00
6/22/2016	DLC	PREPARED FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR TEMPORARY INJUNCTION	2.50	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$687.50
6/22/2016	DLC	DRAFTED AMENDED ORDER, AMENDED MOTION FOR TEMPORARY INJUNCTION	4.00	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$1,100.00
6/22/2016	DLC	REVIEWED FILINGS FROM ATTORNEY GENERAL REGARDING MOTION TO INTERVENE AND COMPLAINT	1.00	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$275.00
6/22/2016	MKR	RESEARCH AND DOWNLOAD ALL NEWS ARTICLES ON CURRENT BEVIN CASES AND CONSTRUCT RESEARCH FOLDERS AND MEDIA BINDER/INDEX	1.30	hrs	\$130 /hr	\$169.00
6/22/2016	MKR	MEETING REGARDING CASE STATUS AND HEARING UPDATES	0.20	hrs	\$130 /hr	\$26.00

6/22/2016	KTR	TELECONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY IN WORKERS COMPENSATION CASE; REVIEW MOTION TO INTERVENE FILED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL; REVIEW MOTION FOR TRO FILED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL; PULL TOGETHER DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION OF HEARING	2.10	hrs	\$195 /hr	\$409.50
6/22/2016	KTR	REVIEW ITEMS TO ACCOMPLISH FOR HEARING PRESENTATION; BEGIN PULLING SERVICE PACKETS FOR HAND DELIVERY; CONFERENCE REGARDING FINZALIZING AMENDED MOTION FOR INJUNCTION AND UPCOMING HEARING; REVIEW ATTORNEY GENERAL PRESS CONFERENCE ON INTERVENING IN CASE FOR USE IN HEARING PRESENTATION	2.60	hrs	\$195 /hr	\$507.00
6/23/2016	KLC	PREPARE INJUNCTION HEARING PRESENTATION; REVIEW CASE FILINGS AND LAW TO PREPARE INJUNCTION PRESENTATION; TRAVEL TO AND FROM FRANKFORT FOR HEARING; APPEAR AND PARTICIPATE IN HEARING	10.20	hrs	\$260 /hr	\$2,652.00
6/23/2016	DLC	ATTENDED HEARING ON MOTION FOR TEMPORARY INUNCTION AND ATTORNEY GENERAL'S MOTION	3.50	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$962.50
6/23/2016	DLC	TRAVELLED TO AND FROM FRANKFORT, KENTUCKY FOR HEARING ON TEMPORARY INJUNCTION	2.00	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$550.00
6/23/2016	DLC	PREPARED FOR HEARING ON MOTION FOR TEMPORARY INJUNCTION	2.50	hrs	\$275 /hr	\$687.50
6/23/2016	KTR	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW CITED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL; REVIEW STATUTE CITED BY ATTORNEY GENERAL IN REGARDS TO THE BOARD OF TRUSTEE'S DUTIES; REVIEW MOTION TO DISMISS FILED BY BEVIN TO PREDICT LEGAL ARGUMENTS AT HEARING	1.60	hrs	\$195 /hr	\$312.00
6/23/2016	KTR	TRAVEL TO FRANKFORT KENTUCKY AND ATTEND HEARING ON MOTION FOR INJUNCTION AND ATTORNEY GENERAL'S MOTION FOR TRO	5.30	hrs	\$195 /hr	\$1,033.50

6/24/2016	KLC	TELEPHONE CALL WITH CLIENT REGARDING CASE STATUS AND SCHEDULE; REVISE PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER; REVIEW ADDITIONAL KRS BACKGROUND INFORMATION NEEDED FOR BRIEFING	1.30	hrs	\$260 /hr	\$338.00
6/24/2016	KTR	DRAFT PROPOSED SCHEDULING ORDER; CONFERENCE REGARDING SCHEDULING ORDER; SEND CORRESPONDENCE TO ATTORNEY GENERAL'S OFFICE; REVIEW COURT ORDER; CONFERENCE REGARDING INFORMATION TO REQUEST FROM KRS AND UPCOMING REPLY	2.10	hrs	\$195 /hr	\$409.50
Total fees for this matter						<u>\$19,971.50</u>

BILLING SUMMARY

Collins, Dana L	27.10 hrs	275.00 /hr	\$7,452.50
Chlarson, Kevin L.	29.50 hrs	260.00 /hr	\$7,670.00
Reisz, Katherine T	23.60 hrs	195.00 /hr	\$4,602.00
Rennirt, Melissa K	1.90 hrs	130.00 /hr	\$247.00
TOTAL FEES	82.10 hr		\$19,971.50
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL			<u>\$19,971.50</u>
BALANCE DUE			<u>\$19,971.50</u>