BOND, SCHOENECK & KING, PLLC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

7500 College Boulevard, Suite 910
Overland Park, Kansas 66210-4035

IRS. NO. 27-0015651

TEL: (913) 234-4400
FAX: (913) 234-4401

CATHERINE S. MIZELL, ESQ.
GENERAL COUNSEL AND SECRETARY
THE UNIVERSITY OF TENNESSEE

719 ANDY HOLT TOWER

KNOXVILLE, TN 37996-0170

For Legal Services Rendered through 03/31/10.

NCAA INVESTIGATION

650740

Date Init, Hours

03/01/10 MSG 3.50

03/02/10 CDS 1.00
MSG 1.00

03/03/10 CDS 1.00

April 16, 2010
Bill Number: 19412343

i :.~. ﬂ e -
g

APR 21 2000

Office of the Vice Prasigont
Goengral Counsel & Szt L

Description

Worked on file; correspondence and telephone conference
with Ms. Thompson (NCAA) regarding interviews and
records requests; telephone conference and correspondence
with Mr. Bertani regarding
B tclephone conference with attorney  Scoggins
regarding

Conferred with attorney Glazier regarding ;
reviewed
partticipated in NCAA interview with Mr. Sorrells; made

notes to file.

Telephone conference and correspondence with Ms.
Thompson (NCAA) regarding interviews with prospective
student-athletes’ coaches; conferred with Mr. Schoemann
regarding interviews; worked on file.

Participated in NCAA interview with Mr. Jeter; made notes
to file.

Accounts Are Due Within 30 Days,

Page: 1



BOND, SCHOENECK & KNG, PLLC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

7500 College Boulevard, Suite 910
Overland Park, Kansas 66210-4035

IRS. NQ. 27-0015651

TEL: (913) 234-4400
FAX: (913) 234-4401

THE UNIVERSITY OF TENNESSEE

Date

[t td

-03/05/10

03/08/10

03/09/10

03/10/10

Init.

MSG

MSG

MSG

MSG

Hours

1.00

0.75

2.00

1.00

0.50

1.50

April 16,2610
Bill Number: 19412343

Description

Participated in NCAA telephone conference interview with
M. Rozier, coach of prospective student-athlete M. Ambles;
follow-up with Ms. Thompson (NCAA); worked on file.

Telephone conference with Ms. Thompson (NCAA)
regarding interviews; participated in NCAA telephone

conference with attorney Bean for ||| G

Reviewed email from attorney Glazier and Ms. Thompsen,
NCAA, regarding interview with Mr. Ambles and M.
Ambles; conducted interview with Mr. Ambles and M.
Ambles with Mr. Weatherington, NCAA.

Correspondence with Ms. Thompson (NCAA) regarding
records requests and interviews; correspondence with Mr.
Bertani regarding reviewed phone calls issue with
Ms. Thompson; worked on file; conferred with attorney
Skillman regarding

Prepared email regarding M. Ambles interview to Ms.
Thompson, NCAA; conferred with attorney Glazier
regarding

Telephone conference with Mr, Hamilton regarding [JJJj

B tclcphone ¢

Bertani regarding

onferences and correspondence with Mr.

correspondence with Ms. Thompson (NCAA) regarding
interviews, phone records, etc.; correspondence with Ms.
Thompson regarding self-reporting secondary violations;
telephone conference with Mr. Bertani regarding [

Accounts Are Due Within 30 Days.

Page: 2



BOND, SCHOENECK & KNG, PLLC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

7500 College Boulevard, Suite 910

Overland Park, Kansas 66210-4035

IRS. NO. 27-0015651

“TEL: (913) 234:4400
FAX: (913) 234-4401

THE UNIVERSITY OF TENNESSEE

| 03/11/10 - MSG 2.00
03/12/10 ) .'MSG' 3.00
03/15/10 MSG 3.00
03/16/10 MSG 12.00
03/17/10 . MSG 8.00
03/18/10 MSG 800

April 16,2010
Bill Number: 19412343

Telephone conferences and correspondence with Ms.

Thompson (NCAA), Mr, Bertani and attorney Bean
regardin . reviewed records for
; prepared .

Reviewed

; telephone conferences an
correspondence with Ms. Thompson (NCAA) regarding
records requested and regarding interviews; reviewed and
prepared for campus interviews.

Correspondence. and telephone conferences with attorney
Scoggins, attorney Bean, Mr, Bertani and Ms. Thompson

ocan) regarding [ T rcvieved end

prepared file for campus interviews.

Traveled to Knoxville and reviewed for interviews; -
participated in NCAA interviews with '
and , meeting with Mr, Hamilton et al; meeting
with Ms. Thompson (NCAA); reviewed and prepared for
interviews, '

Participated in NCAA interviews with D. Blackbum, J.
Chaney, L. Thompson, S. Rubio and [ mecting with
attorneys Lapps and Scoggins; telephone conferences with
Mr. Bertani; meetings with Ms. Thompson (NCAA);
reviewed and prepared for interviews.

Participated in NCAA interviews with K. Strongin, K.A.
Hawkins and V. Granger; meeting with Ms. Thompson and

attorney Scoggins; meeting with attorney Scoggins and M.
Bertani; return travel and worked on h;

corresponidence with Mr, Bertani.

Accounts Are Due Within 30 Days,

Page: 3



BOND, SCHOENECK & KING, PLL.C
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

7500 College Boulevard, Suvite 910
Overland Park, Kansas 66210-4035

IRS. NO. 270015651

“TEL: (913) 234-4400
FAX: (913) 234-4401

THE UNIVERSITY OF TENNESSEE

03/19/10

03/24/10

03725110

03/26/10

Summary

MSG (Mike Glazier) 54.00 hours @ $310/hour
KRS (Kyle Skillman) 2.50 hours @ $195/hour
CDS (Chris Schoemann) 2.00 hours @ $205/hour

MSG 2.00
MSG 1.50
MSG 4.50
MSG 1.25
Total Fees for Matter;

April 16, 2010
Bill Number: 19412343

Correspondence and telephone conference with Ms.
Thompson (NCAA) regarding rules education and S. Rl.lbl()
status; reviewed documents and prepared

worked on .

Correspondence with Ms. Thompson
attorney ~ Scoggins  regarding

correspondence with Mr. Bertani regarding
; prepared correspondence and submission of|
materials to Ms. Thompson.

CAA), and with

Worked on submission of| materials to NCAA;
correspondence and telephone conferences with Mr. Bertani
and with Ms. Thompson

. wortked on document;

reviewed and prepared
; worked on file; telephone conferences and
correspondence with attorney Bean and Ms. Thompson
regarding follow-up interview with

Telephone conferences and correspondence with Mr.
Bertani and with Ms. Thompson (NCAA), telephone

conference and correspondence with attorney Bean; worked
on file.

. $17,637.50 .

(continued on next page)

Accounts Are Due Within 30 Days.

Page: 4



BOND, SCHOENECK & KING, PLLC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

7500 College Boulevard, Suite 910

Overland Park, Kansas 66210-4035

IRS. NO. 27-0015651

" TEL: (913) 234-4400
FAX: (913) 234-4401

THE UNIVERSITY OF TENNESSEE

Matter Disbursement Summary
Airfare — M. Glazier — Knoxville (3/16 —3/18)
Hotel Charges '
Rental Car _
Travel Expenses ($36.80 airport mileage; $60 airport parking)

Meals (3/16 - $4.13L, $24.76D; 3/17 $7.05L, $34.22D —chg'dto - -
$28 per diem; 3/18 $14.42B —chg’d to $11.20 per diem, $15.54L)

Copy Charges
Fax Charges
Long Distance Telephone Charges

April 16,2010
Bill Number: 19412343

1019.30
196.88
240.57.

96.80,

90.68.

252.05
9.00
18.87

Total Disbursements

TOTAL FOR THIS MATTER

$1,924.15

$19,561.65

APPROVED &Y.

Accounts Are Due Within 30 Days.

Page: §



BOND, SCHOENECK & KING, PLLC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

7500 College Beulevard, Suite 910
Overland Park, Kansas 66210-4035

IRS. NO. 27-0015651

- TEL: (913) 234-4400
FAX: (913) 234-4401

CATHERINE S. MIZELL, ESQ.

- GENERAL COUNSEL AND SECRETARY
THE UNIVERSITY OF TENNESSEE

719 ANDY HOLT TOWER

KNOXVILLE, TN 37996-0170

REMITTANCE ADVICE
(Please return this page with your payment)

ClientID: 058678

Matter ID: 650’740

Total Legal Services
Total Disbursements
Total for Bill Number ; 19412343

Use the following instructions if you wish to wire funds for payment of this bill:

Accounts Are Due Within 30 Days.

Page: 6

April 16,2010
Bill Number; 19412343

$17,637.50
1,924.15
$19,561.65
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@3/23/2918 11:26 9134513685 WINGGATE TRAVEL PAGE

WINGGATE TRAVEL INC.\ 087730 DUPLICATE RECEIPT

8645 COLLEGE BLVD. S£TE 100\ PAGE NO. 1
CVERLAND PARK KB 66210\ PNR: 1P-MZOMCS

913-451-%200 PHONE\

BOND SCHOENECK KING PLLC
7500 COLLEGE BLVD STE 9]0
OVERLAND PARK KS 66210-4D35

NAME : GLAZIBR/MICHAEL
AGENT BRANCH ACCOUNT NO. DATE

DIANE — 12MAR1Q

* ELECTRONIC TICKET * POSITIVE IDENTIFICATION REQUIRED AT CHECK-IN

**REQUEST TERMS/CONDITTONS OF TRAVEU AND CARRIER LIABILITY NOTICES FROM
TRAVEL, AGENCY OR THE TRANSFORTING CARRIER.**

RESTRICTIONS-NONREFUNDABLE/CHANGE FEE MAY APPLY/

ISSUED BY-WINGGATE TRAVEL OVERLAND PARK KS

CO DATE CITY-AIRFORT TIME FLICGHT NBR/CLASS 8T SERV/AMET
A 7U 16MAR LV KANSAS CITY INTL 620A  DELTA 7264M OK
AR MEMPHIS 7452 0gTOP DI5

SEAT 06-1) **RESERVED**
GLANIER/MLCHAEL
NOT VALID FOR TRAVEL~BEFORE 16MAR/AMTER 16MAR

A TU 16MAR LV MEMPHIS 834a  DELIA 40508 CK
AR KNOXVILLE 1050a 0STOF CRJ
OFERATED BY PINNACLE DBA DBELTA CCGNNECTION
SEAT 04-F **RESERVED** o
GLAZ TER/MICHAEL )

NOT VALID FOR TRAVEL-BEFQORE 16MAR/AFTER 16MAR

€ TU 16MAR NATIONAL CONFQ-856784787B00TH
MCGHEE-TYSON AIRP-TERMINAL PICKUP-16MAR TUE/DL4050-1050
2055 AIRPORT HWY
KNOXVILLE YTENNBSSEE RETURN-18MAR THU/1417

PHONE—-888-826-6890

RATE- (GUARANTEED) USD 57.39 DAILY UNLIMITED MILEAGE
EXTRA DAY CHARGE 57.39 UNLIMITED MILEAGE

EXTRA HOUR CHARGE 28.70 UNLIMITED MILEAGE
ESTIMATED TOTAL PRICE IS 214.1% 03D

1 PULL SIZE CAR

RESERVED FOR GUAZIER MICHAEL 8

CORPORATE ID-5007128

A MINIMUM OF 3 DAYS WILL EE CHARGID

CICB5766

H TU 156MAR TOWNEPLACE STES MARRIOTT KNOXV CIHECK IN- 16MAR TUE/1600
205 LANGLREY PLACE CHECK OUT-18MAR THU/1200
KNOXVILLE TN U8 37922 GUARANTERD TO CREDIT CARD-AX
PHONE-~8656935216

FAX-8656935240
CONFO-90037287

REGULAR RATE STUDIC 1 QUEEW SOFABED
RATE INF(O-139.00
H TU 16MAR TOWNEPLACE STES MARRIOTT RNOXV CONTINUED

RATE GUARANTEED-USL



@3/23/2818 11:26 9134519680 WINGGATE TRAVEL PAGE
WINGGATE TRAVEL INC.\ 087730 DUPLICATE RECEIPT
8645 COLLEGE BLVD. STE 100\ PAGE NO. 2
QVERLAND PARK KS 66210\ PNR: 1P~-MZOMCS
913-451-9200 PHONE\

CO DATE CITY-AIRPORT TIME FLIGHT NBR/CLASS ST SERV/AMNT
A TU L6MAR LV MEMPHIS B34A DELTA 4050M OK CONTINUED

CANCEL RQRMTS-CANCEL PERMITTED UP TO 4PM DAY OF ARRIVAL
HOTEL TIME. 158.81 CANCEL FEE PER ROOM.
PERSONS INCLUDED IN RATE-1 FREQUENT GUEST NBR-000867010
RQST VIP ATHLETIC RATE NOSMOKING KING PLEAE

VIP ATHLETIC RATE IS NOT AVAILABLE

A TH 18MAR LV RNOXVILLE 317P  DELTA 5268H OK
AR ATLANTA 429P 0STOP ChJ
OPERATED BY ASA DBA DELTA CONNECYION
SEAT  08-)3 *¥RESERVED**
GLAIER/MICHAEL
NOT VALID FOR TRAVEL-BEFORE 1BMAR/AFTER 18MAR

A TH 18MAR LYV ATLANTA ~ 70LF  DELYA - 1587H OX
AR KANSAS CITY INTL  BIBP _ 08TOP M40
NOT VALID FOR TRAVEL-BEFORE 18MAR/APTER 18MAR
SEATING RESTRICTED TO AIRPORT CHECKIN ONLY

V TU 30NOV RETENTION LINE CONFIRMED
2010 }

TICKET NUMBER(S): E0067465836927
SERVICE FEE MCO:™ 8900512173856

AIR FARE 880.01

TAX 104,39

TOTAL AIR FARE 984.39

SERVICE FEE 35.00

AMOUNT CHARGED 1019.30

THIS AMOUNT WILL BE CHARGED TO CREDIT CARD: AX XXXX XXXXXY X3026

****PLEASE REVIEW TICKET FOR ACCURACY.

CONTACT US WITHIN 24 HOURS IF ANY BERRORS EXI.T,
PLEASE NOTE*EFFECTIVE JANDOD 2007-FOR ALL AIR
CHECKED BAGGAGE FEES MAY APPLY

EACH AIRLINES POLICY WILL VARY-CHECK THEIR WHBSITE
FOR AFTER HOUR EMERGENCY TRAVEL-~CONTACT

THE RESERVATION CENTER AT 800-609-2530

PROVIDE VIT CODE PIVG

THERE I5A 20,00 FEE FOR EACH CALL

PLUS ADD#TIONAL FEREE XF TICKETS NEED T0 BE IHSUED

THANK YOU FOR YOUF BUSINESS

82/92



4/15/2010 L Bond, Schoeneck & King, PLLC . ‘ Report: DISBU2

926 AM -~ . . Disbursement Subsidiary Report - Req'd By: ROSATES

Includes: Hard,Soft,Billed,Unbilled Peripd: 180001 1o 201004 Date: 1/1/1800 to 3/31/2010 Currency: USD

Tran Date Code  Description Inw/Chk Req # Disb ID Reference Bill Num Bill Date Basa Amount To Bdl Amount Billed Amount
e —— AR AR R N

Client: 058678 Tha University of Tennessee

Matter: 650740 NCAA Investigation
Dish Code: 9000 Long Distance Telephone Charges
Base_Gty: 0.000000

3112010 2000  Long Distance Telepho 3297067 1865)974-3672 19412343 462010 $0.15 $0.15 . 8015
a8M/2019 9000  Long Distance Telephor 3297068 1(865)974-3245 19412343 411672010 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15
aiizote 3000  Long Distance Telephal 3287070 1B17)917-6042 19412343 aMe200 $0.90 $0.50 $0.50
31/2010 5000  Long Distance Telepha 3297076 1{865)207-1736 19412343 4162010 $0.90 $0.90 %080
3172010 9000  Long Distance Telephor 3207083 1@1ITeIT6222 19412343 4162010 $1.95 $1.85 $1.95
202010 5000  Long Distance Telephor 3297548 1(317)917-6222 19412343 42010 $0.30 $0.30 $0.30
3/5/2010 9000 Long Distance Telepher 3299336 1317917-6021 19412343 4162010 $0.75 $0.75 50.75
/52010 S000  Long Distance Telephor 3299356 1@171817-6222 19412343 4162010 $1.35 $1.35 $1.35
N5/2010 5000  Long Distance Telepho: azoase? 1(865)207-1738 19412343 4N16£2010 $0.50 $0.90 ' $0.90
/52010 9000  Long Distance Telephor 3299363 1317)917-6222 19412343 4116/2010 $0.15 © o g0as . $0.15
39/2010 8000  Long Distance Telepho 3300782 1BI7N)917-6028 19412343 411612010 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15
302610 9000 Long Distance Talephor 3301331 1(865)207-1738 19412343 A116/2010 . $0.75 $0.75 $0.75
315/2010 9000  Long Distance Telephos 2302659 1(865]974-2356 15412343 4162010 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50
31512010 9000  Long Distance Telephot 3304854 1BTIPIT-E214 19412343 411802010 $2.10 $2.10 | 210
3/15/2010 9000 Long Distance Telephor 3304851 13170176222 19412343 411612010 $0.15 $0.15 0.8
/1572010 9000  Long Distance Telepho 3304862 1(317017-6022 19412343 4162010 : $0.30 $0.30 $0.20
319/2010 9000 Long Distance Tetephol 3305545 1317)817-6032 19412343 S anemoto : $0.30 $0.30 © $0.30
V2372010 9000  Long Distance Telephol 3306918 1(865)637-123¢ 19412343 NE2010 $0.30 $0.30 - $0.30
w25/2010 3000  Long Distance Telephal 3306129 1E15)254-0400 19412343 e $0.15 $0.15 - $045
8/26/2010 5000  Long Distance Telepho 3308736 18659744043 19412343 4162010 $0.45 $0.45 | 5045
U2E/2010 9000  Long Distance Telepho 2308737 1BES)H74-4043 19412343 41572010 $0,30 $0.30 $0.30
3/26/2010 9000  Long Distancs Telepho! 2308741 1(3I7OIT-6222 18412343 " 4182010 $0.60 $0.60 | $0.60

se_Qty 0.000000 Totals . ) $14.55 $14.55 $14.55

Dist Code Total: 9000 : $14.55 $14.55 $14.55

Dish Code: 5001 Long Distance Telephone Charges
Base_Qty: 0.000000

Ns2O10 8001  Long Distance Telephor 52181346 3309161 19412343 4/16/2010 $4.32 $4.32 © §432
se_Qity 0.000000 Totals $4.32 $4.32 $4.32
Disk Code Taotal: 9001 $4.32 $4.32 © %432

Disb Code: 9051 Copy Charges

Page: 1



4/15/2010 Bond, Schoeneck & King, PLLC Report: DISBO2

926AM -~ . . - Disbursement Subsidiary Report Req'd By: ROSATES
includes: Hard,Soft,Billed,Unbiiled Pericd: 180001 to 201004 Date: 1/1/1800 to 3/31/2010 Currericy: usD
Tran Date Code  Description InvfChk Req # Disb ID Refecence Bilt Num Bitl Date Base Amount To Bil Amount Bilied Amount
_ L )
Base_Qfty: 5.000000
3/3/2010 9051  Copy Charges 3297311 18412843 4162010 $1.25 $1.25 $1.25
2402010 9051  CopyCharges 33066656 16412343 4162010 $1.25 $1.25 $1.25
se_City 5.000000 Totals $2.50 $2.50 $2.50
Base_Qty: 10.000000
V252010 9051  Copy Charges 2307214 19412343 4162010 $2.50 $2.50 . $250
3_Cty 10.000600 Totals : £2.50 $2.50 $2.50
Base_Qty: 72.000000
3M72010 5051  Copy Charges 3296080 18412343 4116/2010 $18.00 $18.00 © $18.00
3_Oty 72.000000 Totals $18.00 $18.00 © $18.00
Base_Qty: 104.000000
a0 9051  Copy Charges 3296138 . 19412343 4162010 $25.60 $25.60 . $25.60
Oty 104.000000 Totals L $25.60 $25.60 ' $25.80
Base_Qty: 175.000000 . . o
12572010 9051  Copy Charges 3307206 19412343 4116/2010 $36.25 $36.25 $36.25
_Cry 175.000000 Totals $3625 $36.25 $38.25
Base_Qty: 1048.000000 )
3122010 9051  Copy Charges B[OITIS . 19412343 41B/2010 $167.20 $167.20 $167.20
Dy 1043.000000 Totals $167.20 $167.20 $167.20
Disb Codo Total: 9051 $252.05 $252.05 $252.05
Disb Code: 9700 Fax Charges
Base_Qty: 7.000000
3/25/2010 9700 Fax Charges 3307729 19412343 4162010 . $3.50 $3.50 $3.50
se_QOty 7.000000 Totals $3.50 $3.50 $3.50
Base_QCty: 11.000000
3/25/2010 9700  Fax Charges 3307704 19412343 415/2010 $5.50 $5.50 $5.50
»_Oty 11.000000 Tatals - ‘ $5.50 $5.50 . 8550
Dish Code Total: 9700 $9.00 $9.00 " $9.00
Matter Total: 650740 $279.92 $279.92 ‘s279.92
Client Total: 058678 . N $279.92 s279.92 | $279.92
Feport Total: $279.92 $279.92 | $279.92

Start Time: 9:26 AM
End Time: 9:26 AM

Page: 2



(Bpplebee's)

APPLEBEE’S
NEIGHRORHOOD GRILL & BAR
2564 Alcoa Huwy
Alcoa TN 37701
(865) 984-G444

CHRISTINA O TB#064
DATE: ©3-18~10 TIME: 13:46 GUESTS: 1

1 HWATER .00

1 ORIENT CHX SAL 8.99

1 W/ TOMATO BASIL  2.49
Check TOTAL: 11.48

TAX: 7.08
Total Due: 12 .54
AMEX 12 .54
BALANCE : 0 .00

Duplicate # 2
MARCH MADNESS!

WATCH ALL THE GAMES HERE!
ASK HOW YOU CAN WIN
A HOOP, AND SHOOTH

G0 VOLS!!

ADDY L'ﬂt!:Q' M POA CACCRANY |

Hpplebeds

APPLEBEE’S
NEIGHBORHOOD GRILL & BAR
2564 Alcoa Hey
Alcoa TN 37701
(865} 984-5444

USER: CHRISTINA O AMEX
DATE: 03-18-10 TIME: 13:46 CTRL: 22398

CARD NUMBER:  #¥x+wxsks3020
EXP DATE: w44
APPROVAL CODE: 525862
AMOUNT : 12.54

TIP: #£.
TOTAL: N’-};’ﬁ_'__

X

Cardmember agrees to pay fotal in
accordance with agreement governing
use of such card.

L4 DHEDT POOY 4

Thark you for eating at McDonald's
Please check your order for accuracy
o received. Have a nice day!

2506 CHAPMAN HMY
KNOXVILLE, TN 37820

THANK YOO
CHAPMAN 1 382 TEL® (865)577-0097

12 KS#13  S#1  Ma .16710(Tue)11:43
STORE# 392

2 HNYMU SNACK WRAP-UPY z.18
1 BOTTLED WATER 1.00
SUB TOTAL 3.76
TAKE QUT TAX 0.35

4.13
CASH TENDERED 5.20
CHANGE 1.07



@\

RUTH’S

STEAK HOUSE

Ruth's Chris Steak House
950 Volunteer Landing lLane

Knoxville, TN 37915

B65-546-4696

Date: Mar17'10 07:48PM
Card Type: Amex
Aot #: XEXXXXXKNXXI026
Card Entry: SWIPED
Trans Type: PUnCHASE
Trans Key: AFE002944389559%
Gttt 0 e 3n35¢
. R
T, 845/1
wetk .D: S GLAZIER
r 10.74> Gerala
Jtotal: 58 .45
Gratuity: (809
Total : e &,ﬁ";_jf_

Guest's Copy
Perfection is in the details
ind we cover them all for vou.
Lsx us dbout our Private Dining

Accommodations today!
Reservations & Gift Cards
Available at RuthsChris.conm,

Ted @ K=
P P 34>

Ruth’s Chris Steak House
950 Volunteer Landing Lane
ncaville, ™ 37915
8R5-54b 1696

1017457 Gerald

Th1 95/1 Chk 5677 Gst 1

55 GLAZIER
Wor " 07°00PH

Tou 1 ,8.45

Perfection is in the details
and we cover them all for you.

Ask us about ocur Private Dining
Accommodations today!

Reservations & Gift Cards
Available at RuthsChris.com,



PARADTES AIRPORT SHOPS - KNOXVILLE
KNOXVILLE INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT
KNDXVILLE. TN

EC-FANCY MOJD MIX 71530721000

399K
EC-ENERGY TRAIL MIX 426328: 100

3.93n

$p oy 0.98-

G 35791687003

5.99 #+
PURF | IFE WATER 46362472000

2.29 T
SUBTOTAL $13.28
TRY $0.37
WATER $0 19
CONYENIENCE $0.58
TOTaL ﬂ___ $14.42
CASH - $20.42
CHANGE $6.00
TTEMS 4 M., NATALIA

03/18/2010 ©3:50PH 0618 01 17215 1073

Thank You for Shieping at
The Foradies Shoes
KNCXVILLE INTERNATIONAL ARIRPORT

Mchltister's Geal
wwy . utdini .g.com
8RR -9T74-4111

107 Tracy ]
147 MARV1:' +  :::Hr .
17 -
1 Nar ¢
I
1
a.
Trange .. /]Eé 43
Tnarn
MCAL. 1S .-t 9



A\g\!\\@ﬂ"ﬂ GUEST FOLIO
OTELS & RESORTS

KNOXAILLE S00 Hill Avenue SE, Xnoxville, TN 37915 - B65.637.1234 « Marriott.com/TYSMC
—— KNOXVILLE MARRIOTT GUEST FOLIO
821 GLAZIER/MICHAEL 161.00 03/18/10 12:00
REOM  NaMAME RRATE ART Tmqine ACCT#
NKNG BOND SCHOENECK & KIN 03/16/10 19:46
TVPE ATNYERIVE Timey|ME
37
CEERK YMENT MR#: XXXXX7010
BSr As@DRESS poymbit T MEN )

chancrs | Bal 2 MCE L

HILL ST

|

1 24.76
03716 INTERNET 1 12.95 |
03/16 ROOM 1 TEE0 Svoe irasd
03716 ST TAX 21, 1 18:89 ;- svai- A
03716 CITY TAX 21, 1 4.83 i 224258
03716 €O TAX 21, 1 8.05 5 et B |
03717 INTERNET 1 821 12.95 N AR
03717 LAUNDRY 001 1.92 VIR e
03717 ROOM 821, 1 16100 7+ -» R
03717 ST TAX_ 821, 1 ' 14.89 " A s
03717 CITY TAX 821, 1 4.83 . - B .
03717 CO TAX 821, 1 8.05 F w o 2€90
03718 AX CARD $433,12 v e

TO BE SETTLED TO: AMERICAN EXPRESS CURRENT BALANCE .00

THANK YOU FOR CHOOSING MARRIOTT! TO EXPEDITE YOUR CHECK-OUT,
PLEASE CALL THE FRONT DESK, OR PRESS "MENU" ON YOUR
TV REMOTE CONTROL TO ACCESS VIDEO CHECK-OUT.

------------------- SUMMARY OF TAXES e

DESCRIPTION TAXED AMOUNT TAX

B CITY TAX .00 9.66

F COUNTY TAX .00 16.10

G GRATUITY .00 .00

NET CHARGES TAY CREDITS FOL10

407.36 25.7 .00 433.12

AS REQUESTED, A FINAL COPY OF YOUR BILL WILL BE EMAILED TO:
SEE "INTERNET PRI N MARRIOTT.COM

Tell a friend about Marriott Rewards, you’11l both get 1,000 points
when t ey stag -~ up to five friends, five stays each.

That’s up to 25,000 peints for you. Refer Friends, Get Points!

See deta11s at MarriottRewards. com/Friend

Marriott Rewards Account # XXXXX7010 ________ _____
Date 03/16/10-03/18/10 Est. Eligible Revenue $377.58
Est. base Points Earned: 3776

For account activity: 801-468-4000 or www.Marriott.com

KNOXVILLE MARRIOTTY
A\arnott. 5o Wil ave. s.E.
HoTeLS & ResorTts  KNOXVILLE, TN 37915
———————— B65-637- 1234 FAX 865-594-4348

Tiis s1atement 5 yous onty recelpt You have agreed to pay in cash of by approved pers onal check or to authorize us to charge your credit card for all amounts charged to
you. The amount shown In the credits column apposite any cradit card epley in the reference column above will be charged w the credit card number set forth above. {The
mﬂnm

This tetdrantiscenr 1muﬂiﬁ’ bat M*uwnhmmblmwrbukmtmwu
you. aTedisoctbiledyimi ke 1ot athley25aliiysaith eotyeiolitmmtonil] s {tate juagrl dumbaniel habold 5tche
¢rexclip esrdond EANPNWALIRY, RENBAG) it i ploetiit coadcrabimens ok attic tiod taldethiy &y yuu mlloweus such amount, ¥ you

are dirett blfled fn lhe event p:ym:nt ls ot lnadu wiihln 2% dayt afer ¢ chack-nu(, you w1|l owe s |nremst I‘rom  the check-out date on any unpald amount at the rate of 1.5%
ES ding attarney {ees

. Sfm!u-——!_—gg

To secure your next stay, go to Marriott.com




RA 818776461 lne 0
Rental  18-HAR-2010 11:03 AM
KNOXVILLE 4APT
Return 13-MAR-2010 01:51 P
KNOXVILLE ARPY

MICHAEL § GLAZIER
Vehicle # A1196667
Nodal |

WA 1172
Class Driven FCAR  Class Charged ICAR
Licensa¥ G10WN  State/Province ™
Wikmy Oriven &0

Wiy Qut 3
Kikns In 2387
Biiling Ref ALAOCBOR

Charges Ko Unit Price  Amount
Fsd 1fental 2290 22,80

T&H 3 Days 5138 1n2.4r
INNMHAH 0 NiKns 0.00"
CONCESS|ON RECOUP FEE 20.54
BUSINESS Tal 0.58*
VEH RENTAL G €3.000 X 6.49

SALES TAX 99.250 X 17.88

Total Charges UsD 240.57

Deposit AEX 3028

Arount Due USD 240.57

* Tawsble |tom

Subject to Aadil

Your Emerald Club Nurber |s
Emarald Club rantal credits m
ms&ulthln 2:”"3";'1 |

u sn riving you
tpraad Enerald Ciub vehicly.
Custoner service Nurbsr 1-800-486-3334

~N~
N

KANSAS CITY

INTERHATIONAL AIRPORY

PARK NG

fiept# 67503

0Y/18710 26:57  LHZ3 AB 87 THni265780
03/16/10 0217 Tn 03718710 20:32 Out
il 743502

CASH PAID $ 66.00-

‘THANK You
QUEST [ONS/COMMENTS
CALL 816-243-8019



